
Trash and Recycling (per subject unit) 

Co. Name 4/1/2022-
12/31/2022 

2023 2024 2025 (option year) 2026 (option year) 

Waste Management $315.63 $437.64 $455.16 $477.96 $501.84 

J.P. Mascaro & Sons $415.44 $562.68 $574.08 $595.56 $619.20 

Whitetail Disposal $485.82 $667.19 $687.20 $707.82 $729.04 

 

Leaf Collection 

Co. Name 4/1/2022-
12/31/2022 

2023 2024 2025 (option year) 2026 (option year) 

Waste Management No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

J.P. Mascaro & Sons $4,200 $4,368 $4,560 $4,800 $5,040 

Whitetail Disposal $6,500 $6,500 $6,500 $6,500 $6,500 

 


